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Internship at Oxera for graduate economists 
 
 
 
 

Start date: rolling start dates in 2024 
 

Location: Milan or Rome 

Oxera is looking for graduates in 
Economics and Finance to be based in 
one of our Italian offices to support the 
projects for 6-12 months. 

Oxera is a leading economics and 
finance consultancy. For over 40 years, 
Oxera has had a strong reputation for 
solving challenges relating to financial 
economics and valuation in regulatory, 
competition, and litigation settings. 

Our expertise spans multiple fields of 
applied economics and finance, and 
includes competition economics, 
regulation, valuation analysis, 
corporate finance, capital markets, 
behavioural economics, and corporate 
governance. 

This blend of specialist skills and 
knowledge, alongside our deep links 
with leading academics, has earned the 
trust of investors, policymakers, 
regulators, competition authorities, and 
courts and arbitration panels 
throughout the world.  

The team is highly international and has 
particular depth in regulated sectors 
(e.g. energy, transport, financial 
services, telecoms and digital, water). 

Your role: 

• close collaboration with colleagues 

in supporting the team and solving 

complex competition economics 

and/or financial valuation questions; 

• conducting empirical and 

quantitative analysis; 

• help writing reports, presentations 

and articles, independently or in 

conjunction with others. 

What we can offer you:  

• a wide range of high-profile and 

intellectually stimulating projects; 

• highly competitive compensation; 

• a multinational and collaborative  

work environment; 

• the opportunity to work with some of 

the brightest and most experienced 

minds in the industry; 

• first-class, hands-on learning and 

structured training and development 

opportunities. 

About you:  

• candidates should have an excellent 

academic record, with a 

postgraduate degree. The degree 

should cover topics in 

Microeconomics (and ideally also 

some Competition analysis modules) 

and/or Finance; 

• excellent problem solving abilities 

and analytical skills; 

• fluency in Italian and English; 

• knowledge of any other EU language 

would be considered a plus. 

How to apply: 

• please send your CV and a covering 

letter outlining why you are 

interested in an internship at Oxera 

to: giulia.caracciolo@oxera.com.  In 

your covering email, please specify 

that you are interested in internship 

experience. Please also specify your 

preferred location. 

All applicants will receive consideration 
without regard to race, colour, religion, 
sex, national origin or disability, or any 
other legally protected basis, in 
accordance with applicable law. 
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